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Around the Community

» Work Zone Awareness Week April 17 - 21

Move over -

h
Avoid distractions - Keep Ir
Watch for sudden stoppages - In 20
colli
Watch for large vehicles




Around the Community

» Recent Open Houses
>
>
>

March 1: So. 56t Street, Spruce to Van Dorn

March 2: 84th Street, Sandalwood to Elizabeth Drive

April 6: N. 48th Street, Leighton to Superior; N 48t Street Watermain =
Lining; University Place Residential Street Improvements

April 13: So. 40, Rokeby to Yankee Hill Road
May 23 (tentative): West A, West City limits to SW 24th

Thank yo
those w
attend



Utilizing much of the same
information from the
annual reports

5 Boards
Two-page flyer
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WHAT IS LINCOLN ON THE MOVE?

Lincoln on the Move is a voter-
approved street improvement
program that operates in addition
to the City of Lincoln’s existing
transportation budget—the Capital
Improvement Program (CIP).

CIP invested $167 million into Lincoln’s
street infrastructure from 2019-2022.
In that time, Lincolh on the Move funds
added over 20% annually and touched
nearly 114 lane miles of streets.

The City collects and distributes
funding for improvements to existing
streets (73.5%), growth projects (25%)
and a partnership with the Railroad
Transportation Safety District (RTSD)
(1.5%) through a quarter-cent

street investment.

Lincoln on the Move
Funding Distribution

M Improvements
to Existing
Streets

M Growth Projects

Joint Partnership
with RTSD

2019-2022 Capital Improvement Projects

NW 40TH

NW SO0TH

@

VAN DORN 5 « .
#
—i PIONEERS

SW 40TH

Lincoln On The Move
Projects

[l Previously Existing
Transportation Funding

I~ NW 27TH

SW27TH

N |

FLETCHER

() HOLDREGE

~
-
»

ﬁ%om CHENEY,
E@
n

PINE LAKE

YANKEE HILL
FI

Every dollar collected as part of Lincoln on the Move goes directly into

Lincoln on the Move projects.




Around the Community

» Social Media Posts

See insight:

*

LOTM Past Project Highlight LOTM Program Information

Projects Webpage




Projects Webpage

» Lincoln.ne.gov/projects or Lincoln.ne.gov [keyword:LOTM]

Projects Map
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Revenues



Revenues

Revenue Projected vs. Collected
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Joint on

33rd, $0.231M
$0.255M

FY 22/23 LOTM Funds 1.5%

(September 1 - August 31)

» FY 22/23 LOTM projection is $15.4M

» Through January 2022, collections Existing
exceed projections by about $1.6M Streets,
73.5%

» Distributed to the various programs $H-32
as per the percentages laid out in $12.50

the Capital Improvement Program

W Existing Streets @Growth  OJoint on 33rd




Program Updates




Recent Bids

$16,000,000.00

$14,000,000.00

$12,000,000.00

$10,000,000.00

$8,000,000.00

$6,000,000.00

$4,000,000.00

Constructors & Hawkins- no bid

$2,000,000.00

Dax - no bid

|
Pavers - no bid

Dax - no bid
Dax - no bid

Constructors & Hawkins- no bid
MTZ - no bid

Pavers - no bid
Pavers - no bid
Hawkins - no bid

Capitol View (02/22
S61K under estimate

N 48th (02/24 Bid)
$1.1M over estimate

S. 48th (03/06 Bid)
$200K over estimate

S. 40t (03/08 Bid)

.

Capitol View
Neighborhood

Hm Estimate mDax Const. EWMTZ mPavers

N 48th Street, Leighton S. 48th Street, Old
to Superior Cheney to Neb. Pkwy

S. 40th Rokeby to
Yankee Hill Road

K2 m Constructors Hawkins

§$700K under estimate



2023 Street COnStI‘UCtiOn (Estimated $50.4M;542.3M awarded to date)

LOTM Arterials ($10.4M Awarded) Arterials ($24.9M Awarded; Estimated $33.0M)

« §27th, Coronado to Old Cheney (10/26 Bid) Saltillo, 70th to 77th (LPS Bid) (12/01 Bid)

« 84th, Sandalwood to Elizabeth Drive (01/24 West “A”, Coddington to West City Limits
Bid) (12/ 14 Bid)

« 48th [eighton to Superior (02/24 Bid) So. 40th, Rokeby to Yankee Hill (03/01 Bid)

* 548%™, Old Cheney to Neb. Pkwy. (03/06 1t Street south of Denton (Developer Bid

Bid) TBD)
« 14t & Old Cheney - Connector Road (Bid
Date TBD)
LOTM Residential ($1.3M Awarded) Residential Packages ($5.7M Awarded)
» Piedmont Neighborhood (01/11 Bid) » Trendwood Residential Neighborhood (1
* Country Club Neighborhood (2024 Bid - * Indian Village Neighborhood (11/09 Bi
Delayed due to watermain) » University Place Neighborhood (12/

» Capitol View Neighborhood (02/

Note: Items in italicized orange have been bid




Programming update based on current estimates

Existing Street Improvements

$20,000,000.00

$18,000,000.00

$16,000,000.00

$14,000,000.00

$12,000,000.00
- a» a»

$10,000,000.00

$8,000,000.00

$6,000,000.00

$4,000,000.00

$2,000,000.00

District 4

District 1 District 2 District 3

m Estimated 2020-2023  mProgrammed 2024-2025 =w@Delayed mProposed projects mTBD
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Lincoln Citizens’
Transportation Coalition
Study

» Process - 27 Lincoln
Leaders

» 5 months of study

» Complete System,
Policy,

» Funding and Process
Review

» 14 Peer Communities

» 24 COST SAVING
Recommendations

» 19 are complete or
underway, including
an Oversight
Committee (ACT)




Recommendations
Rocommendation _____[status | Recommendation __________[stas

Conduct Periodic Reviews of Lincoln Complete Enhance Backfill Requirements Complete
Transportation and Utilities Guidelines and
Policy

Track Snow Removal Online Complete ram Complete

———
Establish a More Robust Preventative Funding Dependen
aintenance Program

Assure Access Management Policy In Progres
Consistency

Update Complete Streets Policy Updated “Keep the Good, Good” Pavement

Management Approach Lincoln on the Move helping

Continue Emergency Pavement Repair Complete Develop Performance Goals for Arterial Complete
Program and Residential Streets
Increase Pavement Inspection Frequency In Progress Develop an ASR Remediation Plan Funding Dependent

Implement the Traffic Management Master Funding Dependent Develop a Dowel Bar Retrofit Program Funding Dependent
Plan

Curb Cut Flexibility Complete Increase Traffic Operations Center

Staffing Piloting daytime FTE
Consider Flexible Lane Widths Complete Establish a Single Point of Contact on Complete

Private Development
Design Standard Flexibility Construction Complete Increased Private Development Testing & Complete

Inspection
Require Geotechnical Investigations for Complete Simplify Impact Fee Program On Hold
Streets
Require Dowel Bars in Concrete Complete Establish a Transportation Advisory ACT

Construction Committee



Findings

» Street Preservation
+58% Need Repair
+29% Need Rehabilitation

N/
0‘0

» Optimization

<430 Traffic Signals to Maintain
» Growth

< Backlog in New Streets

Alvo

Fletcher

Havelock

Adams

Holdrege

o st

A St

Van Dorn

Pioneers

Old Cheney

Pine Lake

Yankee Hill

Rokeby Rd

Saltillo



Findings

The Funding Gap = S33M per year

100s

S ' More miles of
> 4 safer, smoother
"~ streets

Intersection
upgrades

+25%

Ability to build
streets in growth
areas

$21 million per year

for system preservation and maintenance

S7 million per year

for system optimization, like signal upgrades
and maximizing traffic flow

S5 million per year

for system growth and new streets




LTRP language emphas-lz-lng City of Lincoln Urban Roads
. Program
maintenance

System Operations &

» Chapter 7 (page 11 on PDF) Maintenance, Minor Intersections

. .- The cost to maintain and operate the
Without additional transportation system is increasing. LTU

revenue sources, several employs 125 people to maintain and operate

. . the transportation system, which includes
Impo rtant tran5pc:rtat|cmn street sweeping, snow removal, stormwater,

urban area pl’Cle'Ct and ditch and drainage maintenance, culvert

roaram cateaories will maintenance, minor intersection
pProg 9 improvements, mowing, crack sealing,

not have adequate pothole repair, signing, and pavement

fundina. Additional markings, among other tasks. As the cost of
g- materials, wages and healthcare for

revenue sources, such as employees increases, the cost to complete
continuation of the the essential functions of O&M increases. The

_ City of Lincoln has pursued innovation and
Lincoln on the Move sales the use of technology advances to make

tax, would signiﬁca nt|y efficient use of available resources. An
estimated $1.08 billion is needed for Lincoln's

hEID to meet the O&M program through 2050. The LRTP
commu nit_y’E recommends fully funding Lincoln’s O&M

transportation needs. program.
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Preventative Maintenance by Street Maintenance

Crack Sealing

Lane-Blocks of Crack Sealing

20,000

18,000

16,000

14,000

12,000

10,000

8,000

6,000

4,000

2,000

2015/16 2016/17 2017/18

17,864

2020/21

2017/18 was first year
creation of two dedicat
crack sealing crews

2022 /23 still has four
months to continue
operations this fiscal ye



Preventative Maintenance

Asphalt Rejuvenation Projects

« Typically placed on streets 2-3 years after
resurfacing to keep good streets good

« Extends pavement life at top of curve before
more expensive treatments are needed

» Product helps prevent the asphalt from
becoming dry and brittle, which reduces
cracking and the formation of potholes

» Typically applied every 5 years

« 2019 project sealed 1.7 miles residential
streets and 2.9 miles arterial streets. Project
was completed in 7 days for $128,000.

* Intend to do a 2024 project with a combination
of residential and arterial streets







Preventative Maintenance

PressurePave Projects

Typically placed on streets that have deteriorated
past the point of simple maintenance efforts but
are not in poor enough condition to require a mill
and overlay

Extends the life of our streets at 1/5 the cost of a
mill and overlay

Typically applied every 10 years

Last year’s 4-mile residential project cost
$550,000 and took 4 days. A similarly sized mill
and overlay would have cost $3.35 million and
would take an estimated 10 weeks.

2022 Residential PressurePave Project - City of
Lincoln, NE

Working on a residential package of similar size
for 2023.



https://www.lincoln.ne.gov/City/Departments/LTU/LTU-Projects/Projects/PressurePave
https://www.lincoln.ne.gov/City/Departments/LTU/LTU-Projects/Projects/PressurePave




Roller Compacted Concrete

WHAT IS IT?

Roller-compacted concrete
(RCC) I1s an ultra-tough,
zero-slump concrete with
compressive strengths greater

than 4,000 psi. It is placed
with asphalt pavers to form
a nonreinforced, concrete
pavement. RCC successfully
and economically combines
strength and durability with
ease of construction.

© Portland Cement Association 2010
0020-11-105

When to use it?

RCC pavement is best suited for low-speed, industrial or military applications
such as intermodal yards, distribution centers, or equipment hardstands where
surface smoothness and appearance are secondary to high durability, low
maintenance, and low initial cost.




Roller Compacted Concrete

* RCCP’s use has typically been further South where freeze-thaw cycles and deicing
chemicals are less likely to damage it. Due to the material composition and the surface
finish of RCCP, weathering effects can be more pronounced than with typical pavements
which can lead to a further reduction in the appearance and surface smoothness over
time.

* While RCCP does not require relief (expansion) joints to be installed, they can be included
to control cracking. When joints are installed the load transfer at the joints relies entirely
on the aggregate interlock within the material given no reinforcement steel can be used.

* Specialized equipment is needed to produce and place RCCP and currently there are no
known contractors in this region who provide this product or service.




ACT BUSINESS
» Next Meeting: Thursday, June 22, 2023

» Location: City Hall, LTU Administration, Conference Room
210 or via Zoom

» 2023 Meetings (Thursdays)
» August 24
» October 26
» December 7

» Anything else we need to cover?
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